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Professor Chris Wold came to Lewis & Clark Law School in 1994 to bring an international 
environmental component to the school’s environmental law program. In addition to teaching 
International Environmental Law and International Trade and the Environment, Professor Wold 
directs the law school’s International Environmental Law Project, which provides students with 
practical experience in international environmental law, and teaches several international 
environmental law courses. He has traveled to Australia, Japan, Kenya, South Africa, Zimbabwe, 
and elsewhere to participate in negotiations relating to climate change, the Convention on 
International Trade in Endangered Species and the International Whaling Commission (IWC). 
He has assisted Pacific Island Developing States in the climate change negotiations and 
participated as the legal advisor to the United Kingdom at the IWC. He has helped Mauritius 
develop a plan to protect environmentally sensitive areas and traveled to India as part of the 
Narmada International Human Rights Panel to investigate environmental and human rights 
violations associated with a World Bank funded dam project. He is “Of Counsel” to the 
Environmental Law Alliance Worldwide-U.S. (E-LAW), which provides legal advice and 
assistance to a network of more than 200 public interest lawyers and scientists from more than 50 
countries who are working to strengthen domestic environmental law. He previously was a 
member of the Environmental Protection Agency’s National Advisory Committee to provide 
advice on matters relating to NAFTA’s environmental commission. 
 
He is the lead author of Trade and the Environment: Law and Policy (2d ed. 2012) and Climate 
Change and the Law (2d ed. 2012). He has also published numerous articles on international 
environmental law as well as the effects of trade law on the environment and environmental law. 
His recent scholarship includes The Durban Package and the Goals of Pacific Small Island 
Developing States, ASIL INSIGHTS, Jan. 6, 2012, Leveraging Climate Change Benefits through 
the World Trade Organization: Are Fossil Fuel Subsidies Actionable?, 43 GEORGETOWN J. INT’L 
L. 635 (2012) (with Wilson & Foroshani), and Taking Stock: Trade’s Environmental Scorecard 
after Twenty Years of “Trade and Environment,” 45 WAKE FOREST L. REV. 319 (2010). 
 


